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第十一章 十大语法错误
一、大小写
1.students should go abroad for 
study.

1.Students should go abroad for 
study.

 



2.First of all, It can ensure the quality 
of university education.

2.First of all, it can ensure the quality 
of university education.



二、标点符号
1. People have to devote more time 
and energy to their careers, some 
people are too occupied to spare 
time for their families.

1. People have to devote more time 
and energy to their careers. Some 
people are too occupied to spare 
time for their families.



2.Some people think that students 
should study abroad, other people 
believe that study abroad has some 
disadvantages.

2.Some people think that students 
should study abroad. Other people 
believe that study abroad has some 
disadvantages.



3.This argument is true to some 
degree, however, I believe that 
students should study abroad.

3.This argument is true to some 
degree. However, I believe that 
students should study abroad.



4.Advertisements keep us well-
informed about products, as a result, 
we can compare them and choose 
the best and cheapest one.

4.Advertisements keep us well-
informed about products. As a result, 
we can compare them and choose 
the best and cheapest one.



5.Advertisements keep us well-
informed about products, in addition, 
we can find a job or rent a house 
with the help of advertisements.

5.Advertisements keep us well-
informed about products. In addition, 
we can find a job or rent a house 
with the help of advertisements.



三、名词单复数
1.In my opinion, student should 
study abroad.

1.In my opinion, students should 
study abroad.



2.Study abroad brings student a lot 
of benefit.

2.Study abroad brings students a lot 
of benefits.



3.Going jogging is beneficial hobby 
which help people relax stress.

3.Going jogging is a beneficial hobby 
which helps people relax stress.



4.Sending child to go abroad is a 
luxurious dream for many poor family.

4.Sending children to go abroad is a 
luxurious dream for many poor 
families.



5.Playing PC game lavish parents’ 
hard-earned money.

5.Playing PC games lavishes 
parents’ hard-earned money.



四、时态和语态
 
1.1.1.1.
Now more and more parents sent 
their children to study abroad.

1.1.1.1.
Now more and more parents send 
their children to study abroad.



2.2.2.2.
Many companies are start to use 
Internet to train employees.

2.2.2.2.
Many companies are starting to use 
Internet to train employees.



3.3.3.3.
More and more children has been 
gone abroad to continue their study.

3.3.3.3.
More and more children have gone 
abroad to continue their study.



4.4.4.4.
Citizen’s rights to know truth should 
be respect.

4.4.4.4.
Citizen’s rights to know the truth 
should be respected.



5.5.5.5.
As is know to all, radio will not be 
replace by TV or internet.

5.5.5.5.
As is known to all, radio will not be 
replaced by TV or internet.



6.6.6.6.
With the opening up to the outside 
world, greater changes have been 
taken place in people’s attitude 
towards family and marriage.

6.6.6.6.
With the opening up to the outside 
world, greater changes have taken 
place in people’s attitude towards 
family and marriage.



五、主谓不一致
1.1.1.1.
My arguments is presented below.

1.1.1.1.
My arguments are presented below.



2222
Exploring the unknown places are a 
great pleasure to many people.

2222
Exploring the unknown places is a 
great pleasure to many people.



3.3.3.3.
Rejecting the changes are unwise 
and passive.

3.3.3.3.
Rejecting the changes is unwise and 
passive.



4.4.4.4.
Study abroad bring students a lot of 
benefits.

4.4.4.4.
Study abroad brings students a lot of 
benefits.



5.5.5.5.
The problems which are brought 
about by raising pets is hard to 
resolve.

5.5.5.5.
The problems which are brought 
about by raising pets are hard to 
resolve.



六、there be 句型使用错误
 
1.1.1.1.
There are more and more people go 
abroad nowadays.

1.1.1.1.
There are more and more people 
going abroad nowadays.



2.2.2.2.
In nowadays, there is a great 
number of people choose to study 
abroad.

2.2.2.2.
Nowadays, there are a great number 
of people choosing to study abroad.


